
Phonics English Maths Expressive Art and Design 

In Phonics this half term 
we will continue to learn 
the Phase 2 sounds. We 
will then be focusing on 
sound blending to read 

CVC words. We will also 
be writing simple words by 
segmenting the word into 

sounds. 

In English this half term 
we will be learning 'The 
Nativity’. We will be 

learning these texts using 
different actions and 

creating story maps. We 
will then use this to explore 

and retell the story.  

In Maths this half term we 
will be focusing on 

numbers 1-5. We will be 
looking at the composition 
of these numbers and how 
they are made up to gain 
a deep understanding. We 

will also be looking at 
counting to 10 using 1-1 

correspondence.  

In art this half term we 
will be looking at Pissarro’s 
season paintings. We will 
be exploring which colours 
show us different seasons. 
We will also be singing in 
a group as we move closer 

to Christmas. 
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In Topic this half term we 
will be learning about 
transport. We will be 

looking transport in the 
past compared to the 

present and how this has 

The focus of 
communication and 

language this half term 
will be showing an 
understanding of 
prepositions such as 

The focus of PSED this 
half term will be how we 
can work as a team. We 
will be working together 

and practising how to take 
turns. We will also be 

This half term we will 
develop our fine motor 

skills by using small tools. 
The children will be 

drawing maps, transport 
and creating models. In PE 



changed over time. We will 
also be discussing how we 

can stay safe whilst 
travelling. Please see the 

Knowledge Organiser below 
to see which vocabulary we 

will be focusing on this 
half term. 

‘under’, ‘on top’, behind 
etc. We will also be asking 
and answering questions to 
find out information. We 
will be using vocabulary, 
from recently read stories 

in conversations. 

discussing kindness and 
how we can help others 
and make good choices. 

we will be working on our 
spatial awareness and 

coordination games. We 
will be dancing to music, 

moving with control 
around the floor. 

 
 

 



 


